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PROPOSAL FOR ENGINEERING SERVICES 
Crysler Road Bridge Deck Replacement 

 
City of Independence, MO 

 
 
PROJECT LOCATION AND DESCRIPTION 
 
The Crysler Avenue bridge over the Union Pacific Railroad was originally built in 1980, and is located 
just North of the intersection of S Crysler Ave. and W. Lexington Ave. The superstructure is a 3-span 
steel girder with concrete deck.  The existing bridge length is 125 feet, including abutments. The overall 
deck width 68 ft – 6 inches and the roadway width is 60 ft. Additional features consist of curb and 
gutter, 6 ft sidewalk on the west side and railings atop concrete parapets on each side. 
 
Based on Missouri Department of Transportation inspections, the concrete deck has a poor condition 
rating. Damage consists of spalls and delamination, transverse cracking and expansion joint 
deterioration. The substructure and superstructure are noted to be in a better than satisfactory 
condition. 
 
The project includes roadway engineering, traffic engineering, bridge engineering (including inspection of 
existing bridge), and permitting assistance. 
 
This project will also include the engineering inspection of the adjacent Winner Road bridge that is being 
repurposed as a pedestrian/bicycle facility. 
 
 
SCOPE OF SERVICES 
 
The engineering services covered by this proposal shall include inspection of the existing Crysler Avenue 
bridge to determine appropriate rehabilitation in addition to a deck replacement. Survey and utility 
locations. Evaluation of possible deck replacement options and design of new deck with required 
roadway and traffic engineering. Permitting assistance with UPRR for a construction permit as well as 
applicable city agencies. Completion of Preliminary and Final plans as well as specifications and opinion of 
probably cost. In addition to the scope of work for the Crysler Avenue bridge, the adjacent Winner 
Road bridge will also receive an inspection to determine appropriate repairs to return the bridge to 
good condition. No plan development is anticipated for the Winner Road bridge as part of this scope. 
 
Engineering plans shall be prepared in accordance with current standard MoDOT procedures in the 
format and detail required by the MoDOT Engineering Policy Guide (EPG) and Standards and 
Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction.  The dimensions shown on the plans shall be shown in 
English units of measure.  Basic specifications shall be the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway 
Construction, 2020. 
 
All necessary geologic reports, soils investigation reports, final surfacing recommendations, existing 
right-of-way information, and traffic data to complete this project will be provided to the 
CONSULTANT by the CITY. 
 
Services to be provided by the CONSULTANT shall include the following: 
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1.00 FIELD INSPECTION AND CONCEPT  
The objective of this portion of the services is to provide a complete inspection of the existing 
structures and associated inspection reports. This will involve a site visit and memo style report to 
summarize the findings and recommend additional rehabilitation items in addition to the deck 
replacement for the Crysler Avenue bridge and Winner Road bridge.  When authorized by the 
CITY, CONSULTANT will complete the inspection and provide the CITY: 

 
1.01 Field Inspection – Field inspection will be completed by NBIS qualified bridge inspection 

team leader to document the condition of the bridges and ascertain general quantities 
and items for repair. 

1.02 Evaluate options for deck replacement – Options for deck replacement may include full 
depth precast panels, partial depth panels, reduction in overhang(s) or other options to 
decrease construction time. 

1.03 Topographic Survey – Conduct a topographic survey of the roadway, bridge, and 
railroad items. Coordinate with UPRR to obtain necessary permits, if applicable. Meet 
with UPRR Roadmaster, if allowed by UPRR, to discuss the bridge redecking. 

1.04 Road Diet Concept – Develop a schematic layout of the proposed roadway that 
reduces number of travel lanes on the bridge and approach roadway. Prepare estimate 
of construction costs. 

1.05 Field Inspection Report – Summarize the inspection findings in a memo style report for 
each structure complete with appropriate photos and captions. Recommendations for 
repair items will be included in the report for consideration by the CITY.  

 
2.00 PRELIMINARY ROADWAY DESIGN 

The objective of this portion of the services is to develop preliminary plans. This will involve the 
preliminary design and preparation of construction plans.  When authorized by the CITY, 
CONSULTANT will prepare preliminary plans for the project and will include the following tasks. 

 
2.01  Preliminary Roadway Design 

2.01.01 Add survey info to plans (horizontal/vertical control, utilities, etc) 
2.01.02 Establish existing and proposed horizontal alignments  
2.01.03 Establish existing and proposed vertical profiles 
2.01.04 Evaluate utility locations & methods to minimize utility impacts 
 

2.02  Preliminary Plans and Estimates 
2.02.01 Prepare title/index sheets 
2.02.02 Prepare general notes/utility owner sheet 
2.02.03 Prepare plan/profile sheets 
2.02.04 Prepare cost estimate 
 

2.03 Assemble preliminary plans and submit to CITY and utilities (all plan sections) 
2.04 Preliminary plan revisions (all plan sections) 
2.05 Submit preliminary plans (all plan sections) information to UPRR for review and 

approval. 
2.06 Revise based on UPRR comments and submit for UPRR approval (all plan sections) 

 
3.00   FINAL ROADWAY DESIGN 

The objective of this portion of the services is to finalize roadway plans. This will involve the 
completion of construction plans.  When authorized by the CITY, CONSULTANT will prepare final 
plans for the project and will include the following tasks. 
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3.01 Final Roadway Design 
3.01.01 Finalize alignments, profiles, etc. 
3.01.02 Miscellaneous sidewalk details 

 
3.02 Final plans and estimates 

3.02.01 Finalize title & index sheets/prepare sign & seal sheet 
3.02.02 Finalize general notes 
3.02.03 Finalize plan/profile Sheets 
3.02.04 Prepare paving details 
3.02.05 Prepare summary of quantities sheets 
3.02.06 Prepare Temp erosion control sheets & summary 
3.02.07 Prepare cost estimate 

 
3.03 Assemble plans to utilities submittals (all plan sections) 
3.04 Assemble plans to CITY (all plan sections) 
3.05 Submit final plans (all plan sections) information to UPRR for review and approval 
3.06 Revise based on UPRR comments and submit for UPRR approval (all plan sections) 
 

 
4.00 PRELIMINARY TRAFFIC DESIGN 

 
4.01 Prepare signing installation and removal plans 
4.02 Prepare pavement marking plans 
4.03 Evaluate construction sequencing 
4.04 Evaluate detour route 
4.05 Prepare construction sequencing plans that identify primary phases of construction and 

traffic management strategies 
4.06 Prepare detour sheet 
4.07 Prepare traffic control layout sheets 

 
5.00 FINAL TRAFFIC DESIGN 

 
5.01 Finalize signing, pavement marking, sequencing, detour, and traffic control sheets.  
5.02 Prepare signing details and quantities sheets 
5.03 Prepare pavement marking quantities sheet 
5.04 Prepare traffic control details and quantities.  

 
6.00 PRELIMINARY STRUCTURE DESIGN 

 
6.01 Data collection/Review (as-built plans/record drawings)  
6.02 Preliminary structure plans 

6.02.01 Prepare general plan for deck replacement option chosen 
6.02.02  Prepare preliminary details for other repair items 
 

6.03 Prepare cost estimate (Submittal with roadway plans) 
 
7.00 FINAL STRUCTURE DESIGN 
 

7.01 Final structure design 
7.01.01 Final deck design replacement 
7.01.02 Design of superstructure repairs 
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7.01.03 Design of substructure repairs 
 

7.02 Prepare final plans 
7.02.01 General plan 
7.02.02 Quantities and notes 
7.02.03 Substructure repairs 
7.02.04 Superstructure repairs 
7.02.05 Deck replacement 
7.02.06 Barrier rail 
7.02.07 Fencing 
7.02.08 Rebar and quantities 

 
7.03 Udpate cost estimate 
7.04 Pepare special provisions 

 
8.00 PROJECT MANAGEMENT / ADMINISTRATION / MEETINGS / COORDINATION 
 

8.01 Meetings with CITY – Various in person meetings and conference calls are planned 
8.01.01 In Person meetings are anticipated to be (Kick-off Meeting and Bridge/Road 
Concept Meeting after field work) 
8.01.02  Monthly progress meetings via phone/video – assumed eight. 
 

8.02 Informal meetings with other stakeholders and agencies - A total of two (2) meetings 
are budgeted.  It is assumed that these meetings will be in-person at or near the project 
site. 

8.03 Meeting exhibits, agendas, minutes 
8.04 Permitting 

8.04.01 Coordination with UPRR. This includes reviewing plans for railrod 
requirements, coordination, permits (right-of-entry, construction, etc.) 
8.04.02 Coordinate with city/state agencies for construction permits 
 

8.05 Coordinate with Utilities  for project construction and utility relocations (designed by 
utilities) Include a detailed utility coordination summary in the construction 
documentation and the UPRR coorespondence that lists utilities to be relocated, with 
anticipated schedules and prime contact information. 

8.06 Bidding Services 
 8.06.01 Attend Pre-bid Meeting 
 8.06.02 Respond to request for information and issuing addenda (if necessary) 
 8.06.03 Assist CITY as needed in review of bids 
 
8.07  Construction Administration Services 
 8.07.01 Attend pre-Construction meeting 
 8.07.02  Review contractor shop-drawing and material certification submittals 

 8.07.03 Respond to contractor questions related to designs or plan information.  
 

8.08 Invoicing, Filing, Schedule Reporting, Workload Scheduling - These activities include 
personnel management, invoicing, budgeting, progress reports, maintaining project 
schedule, maintaining contact lists, organizing files and records of TranSystems work 
product.   
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9.00 QUALITY CONTROL / QUALITY ASSURANCE 
 
9.01 Review of plans / specifications / cost estimate prior to each submittal 
  

Deliverables 
 
1. Inspection report – memo style (.pdf) 
2. Conceptual Roadway report – memo style and schematic layout (.pdf) 
3. Preliminary Plans 

3.1 One electronic set of plans (.pdf) and one electronic set of plans for utilities with 
utilities in color (.pdf) to the CITY 
3.2 One electronic set of plans (.pdf) and one electronic set of plans for utilities with 
utilities in color to UPRR (.pdf) 

4. Final Plans  
4.1 One electronic set of plans (.pdf) 
4.2 One set of full size plans and one set of half size plans to the Utilities and CITY. 

(.pdf) 
4.3 One electronic set of job specifications (.pdf) 
4.4 One set of Construction Documents and Permit Form to UPRR (.pdf) 

 
ITEMS TO BE FURNISHED BY THE CITY   
 
1. As-built drawings (not previously provided) of the existing roadways, including cross-sections if they 

are available, as well as bridges, utilities, signing, and pavement markings.   
2. Surfacing recommendations.  
 
ASSUMPTIONS FOR THE PREPARATION OF THIS PROPOSAL 

 
1. The most recent MoDOT procedures, standard plans, and other general letters and information will 

be used for the design of this project. 
2. All plans shall be completed using English units at a scale of 1’ = 20’ for plan and profile sheets and 

other scales, as appropriate, for specific details. 
3. Designing relocated utilities is not provided as a part of this Scope of Services. 
4. A Transportation Management Plan (TMP) is not required for this project 
5. No special aesthetic details will be included other than concrete form liner. 
6. No special drainage systems are anticipated. 
7. There are no signal design elements associated with these services, including any signal warrant 

analyses and temporary signals. 
8. There are no lighting design elements associated with these services. 
9. There are no ITS elements (temporary or permanent devices) associated with these services. 
10. All existing signs disturbed by construction in any manner will be replaced, with the exception of 

special guide signs that are in good condition and can be relocated.   
11. All proposed signs will be ground mounted on standard posts. No special mounting methods, 

structural analyses or special foundation designs will be necessary for any sign 
12. No construction inspection services are included. 
 
PAYMENT PROVISIONS 
 
The CONSULTANT proposes to provide the services as outlined in this proposal on the basis of a 
schedule of rates as follows: 
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INSPECTION, PRELIMINARY, AND FINAL DESIGN SERVICES 
The total cost, , shall not exceed One Hundred Thrirty-Five Thousand Five Hundred Seventy-Two 
Dollars ($135,572.00). This fee is based on the schedule of rates attached. Refer to Exhibit B for an 
estimate of the engineering time and expenses for completing the services outlined in this Scope of 
Work. 
 
SCHEDULE OF SERVICES 
 
The services outlined in the preceding paragraphs will be completed in accordance with the following 
schedule, provided that the time specified shall be exclusive of all delays occasioned by plan reviews or 
any action or inaction by the CITY or other agency incurred following a CONSULTANT plan submittal 
or request for Project related information.  
 
INSPECTION, PRELIMINARY, AND FINAL DESIGN SERVICES 
A. Field Review and Summary Memo – July, 2021 
B. Preliminary Plans, Cost Estimate, and Specifications (30% Plans) – September, 2021 
C. Final Plans, Cost Estimate, and Specifications – January, 2022 
D. Advertise for Bid – February, 2022 
 
 



6/9/2021 PAGE 1 OF 3

EXHIBIT B
Crysler Avenue Deck Replacement

City of Independence, MO

TRANSYSTEMS CORPORATION WORKFORCE AND FEE ESTIMATE
ESTIMATE OF HOURS

TASK # E5 E4 E3 E2 E1 ES4 ES3 ES2 ES1 T4 T3 T2 T1 CS2 A2

TASK 1: FIELD INSPECTION
1.01 Field Inspection 12 32 22
1.02 Evaluate Options for Deck Replacement 8 16
1.03 Topographic Survey 2
1.04 Road Diet Concept
1.05 Field Inspection Report 6 24

TASK 2: PRELIMINARY ROADWAY DESIGN

2.01.01 Add Survey Info to Plans 4
2.01.02 Establish Existing and Proposed Horizontal Alignments 4
2.01.03 Establish Existing and Proposed Vertical Profiles 4
2.01.04 Evaluate Utility Locations & Methods to Minimize Utility Impacts 2

2.02.01 Prepare Title/Index Sheets 4
2.02.02 Prepare General Notes/Utility Owner Sheet 2 2
2.02.03 Prepare Plan - Profile Sheets 2 4
2.02.04 Prepare Cost Estimate 2

2.03 Assemble Preliminary Plans 2
2.04 Preliminary Plan Revisions 2
2.05 Submit Preliminary Plans 2 2 2 2
2.06 Revise Preliminary Plans 1 2 1 2 2

TASK 3: FINAL ROADWAY DESIGN

3.01.01 Finalize Alignments, Profiles, etc. 2
3.01.02 Miscellaneous Sidewalk Details 2

3.02.01 Finalize Title & Index Sheets/Prepare Sign & Seal Sheet 2 2
3.02.02 Finalize General Notes 1 2
3.02.03 Finalize Plan/Profile Sheets 2 2 2
3.02.04 Prepare Paving Details 2 2
3.02.05 Prepare Summary of Quantities Sheets 2 2
3.02.06 Prepare Temp Erosion Control Sheets & Summary 2 2
3.02.07 Prepare Cost Estimate 1

3.03 Assemble Plans to Utilities Submittals 1 2
3.04 Assemble Plans to CITY 2
3.05 Submit Final Plans 2 2 2 2
3.06 Revise and Submit for UPRR 1 2 1 2 2

TASK 4: PRELIMINARY TRAFFIC DESIGN
4.01 Signing installation and removal plans 8
4.02 Prepare Pavement Marking Plans 4 4
4.03 Evaluate Construction Sequencing 4
4.04 Evaluate Detour Route 4
4.05 Prepare Construction Sequencing Plans 4 8
4.06 Prepare Detour Sheet 2 2
4.07 Prepare Traffic Control Layout Sheets 8 4

TASK 5: FINAL TRAFFIC DESIGN
5.01 Finalize Signing, Pavement Marking, etc. Plans 6 2
5.02 Prepare Signing Details 2
5.03 Prepare Pavement Marking Quantities 2
5.04 Prepare Traffic Control Details and Quantities 2 2

TASK 6: PRELIMINARY STRUCTURE DESIGN
6.01 Data Collection/Review (As-Built Plans/Record Drawings) 1 4

6.02.01 Prepare General plan for deck replacement option chosen 16 24
6.02.02 Prepare preliminary details for other repair items 16 24

6.03 Prepare Cost Estimate 2 4

6.02 - Preliminary Plans

2.01- Preliminary Roadway Design

2.02 - Preliminary Plans and Estimates

3.01 - Final Roadway Design

3.02 - Final Roadway Plans and Estimate
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EXHIBIT B
Crysler Avenue Deck Replacement

City of Independence, MO

TRANSYSTEMS CORPORATION WORKFORCE AND FEE ESTIMATE
ESTIMATE OF HOURS

TASK # E5 E4 E3 E2 E1 ES4 ES3 ES2 ES1 T4 T3 T2 T1 CS2 A2

TASK 7: FINAL STRUCTURE DESIGN

7.01.01 Final deck design replacement 8 20 8
7.01.02 Design of superstructure repairs 8 8
7.01.03 Design of substructure repairs 8 16 8

7.02.01 General Plan 4 4
7.02.02 Quantities and Notes 8 8
7.02.03 Substructure Repairs 8 16
7.02.04 Superstructure Repairs 6 12
7.02.05 Deck Replacement 16 8 32
7.02.06 Barrier Rail 6 12
7.02.07 Fencing 4 8
7.02.08 Rebar and Quantities 8 12

7.03 Update Cost Estimate 1 2
7.04 Prepare Special Provisions 2

TASK 8: MEETINGS AND COORDINATION

8.01.01 In Person meetings 4 4
8.01.02 Monthly progress meetings via phone/video 4 8

8.02 Informal meetings with other stakeholders and agencies 4 4
8.03 Meeting exhibits, agendas, minutes 4 2

8.04.01 Coord. with UPRR for permits (right-of-entry, construction, etc.) 2 4 16 2
8.04.02 Coordinate with city/state agencies for construction permits 4

8.05 Coordinate with Utilities 4

8.06.01 Attend Pre-bid Meeting
8.06.02 Respond to RFIs and issuing addenda (if necessary) 2
8.06.03 Assist CITY as needed in review of bids 2

8.07.01 Attend pre-Construction meeting 2 2
8.07.02 Review contractor submittals 4 2 8
8.07.03 Respond to contractor questions and prepare design change 2 8

8.08 General management (Invoicing, filing, scheduling, and workload) 16

TASK 9: QC/QA
9.01 Review of plans / specifications / cost estimate prior to submittal 6 12

Totals 2 30 70 47 0 88 16 222 48 188 22 0 14 22 6

8.07 - Construction Services

7.01 - Final Structure Design

7.02 - Final Plans

8.01 - Meetings with CITY

8.04 - Permitting

8.06 - Bidding Services


